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Abstract 

This paper investigated the relationship among board leadership structure, shareholder rights, the divergence of 
responsibilities, and firm performance under a variety of conglomerate-controlling behaviors. Results revealed a 
negative correlation among chief executive officer (CEO) duality and deviations from stock-control rights, 
earnings-distribution rights, seat-control rights, and stock-control rights on a single family-controlled company’s 
performance. The ratio of shares held by directors and independent directors significantly correlated with the level of 
company performance. This may explain the relationship of current board composition in Taiwanese-listed companies’ 
structure and the phenomenon of business performance. The manager-controlled type is common in Taiwan’s electronics 
industry. We determined that, apart from the significant positive correlation between the numbers of independent 
directors and company performance, the remaining outcomes of the primary variables were not significant. This 
illustrates that the controller of the company is the professional manager. The correlation between the structure of the 
board of directors and company performance was found to be minimally significant. However, independent directors 
were still found to act as important oversight mechanisms. 

Keywords: Conglomerate, Control type, Board leadership structure, Independent directors, Firm performance 

1. Introduction 

The origins of an enterprise typically involve a founder starting a small-scale business. As a result of successful 
operational implementation and the use of various resources, the business gradually expands into a larger company.  
This company may merge with a number of related companies to become a conglomerate.    

The previous empirical literature has generally taken group structure as given and studied the consequences induced by 
its ownership structure. The literature focuses on the relationship between the controlling family’s cash flow and voting 
rights and measures of accounting performance and valuation (Claessens, Djankov, & Lang, 2000; Faccio & Lang, 2002: 
Chang & Shin, 2007). The literature has also examined whether group membership affects valuation (Khanna & Rivkin, 
2001; Khanna & Palepu, 2000; Fisman & Khanna, 2000; Lefort & Walker, 2000; Claessens et al., 2002; Kim, Lim, & 
Sung, 2007; Almeida, Park, Subrahmanyam, & Wolfenzon, 2011). Little empirical research focuses on managerial 
control types of conglomerates and how they influence the company’s performance. We try to fill this gap with this 
paper. 

This study’s conglomerate samples were obtained from the Taiwan Economic Journal database. The definitions of the 
companies were adopted from the Taiwan Economic Journal, with group members that may be part of one family being 
the ultimate controllers of their own companies. The pattern of corporate control within the corporation also implies that 
the company holds substantial control over its business decisions. Such control can be divided into four types: 
government control, single-family control, joint rule, and managerial control. There are relatively few 
government-controlled companies, and they often bear the same consideration of political or policy factors, thereby 
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affecting the direction of the company’s business decisions. Moreover, government-controlled companies are different 
from standard companies that adopt corporate business profit as the primary objective of policy making. This study 
provides a comparative analysis of non-governmental types of control to understand whether the leadership structure of 
the board of directors has differing effects on corporate performance. 

Empirical results have shown that company performance will deteriorate if the responsibilities of company chairperson 
and chief executive officer (CEO) are held by the same person, resulting in agency costs. Taiwan’s listed companies 
have officers serving as chairperson and manager, thus supporting agency theory. The internalization of the CEO has a 
positive and significant correlation with improving the rate of return on equity, which indicates that if the CEO is a 
member of the controlling corporation, he or she will consider the best interests of the corporation. The internalization of 
the company CEO is beneficial in harmonizing company and shareholder interests. The non-alignment of voting-related 
rights (stock control and seat control) and earnings-distribution rights in Taiwan’s listed companies is common. This 
non-alignment has a significant negative relationship to company performance, which indicates that an inconsistency of 
goals between policy makers and shareholder wealth would result in agency costs. The numbers of independent directors 
and company performance  are also significantly and positively correlated. This shows that the larger the proportion of 
independent directors, the more the board can monitor the performance of company management. This result is 
consistent with the direction of government regulations and policies. 

It was determined that a single family-controlled management structure is most prevalent in Taiwan businesses, 
accounting for 62% of the sample. Another variable under consideration was the joint-rule patterns in a company.  It 
was determined that they have a dispersed ownership structure and only deviate in relation to stock-control rights, 
earnings-distribution rights, and company performance.  These variables have a significant negative relationship. There 
was no significant difference in the other variables.  

The single family-controlled company had a negative correlation with the CEO duality and the non-alignment of 
stock-control rights, earnings-distribution rights, seat-control rights, and the company’s performance. The ratio of shares 
held by directors and independent directors was positive and significantly correlated with company performance. This 
may explain the phenomenon of the current board composition of Taiwan’s listed companies, as well as the boards’ 
structure and relationship to firm performance.  

The manager-controlled structure is common in Taiwan’s electronics industry. It was determined that, apart from the 
significant positive correlation between the numbers of independent directors and company performance, the remaining 
outcomes of the primary variables were not significant. This demonstrates that the controller of the company is the 
professional manager. The correlation between the board of directors structure and company performance was found to 
be minimally significant. However, independent directors were still found to act as important oversight mechanisms. 

The remainder of this paper is organized as follows. The next section is a literature review; this is followed by the 
methodology, including a description of the sample data and variable measures. The empirical results are then presented. 
Conclusions and implications are provided in the final section. 

2. Literature Review and Hypothesis Development 

Many aspects of conglomerate firms have been studied. For example, one aspect prevalent in the literature on portfolio 
theory is appraising diversification of conglomerate firm performance (Smith & Schreiner, 1969; Sharpe, 1970; Mason 
& Goudzwaard, 1976). Other aspects examined include the economic theory of conglomerates (Gort, 1969; Mueller, 
1969) and legal aspects of conglomerates (Berg, 1965). This paper examines the ownership structure aspect of 
conglomerates’ performance effects. 

The conglomerate company rules in this paper were adopted from the Taiwan Economic Journal database (TEJ), using 
its definition of the ultimate controller.  The ultimate controller must meet the following conditions: (a) major 
shareholders are members of the same family (the primary shareholder implies the top 10 shareholders or holders of 5% 
or more of the shares), (b) more than one third of the directors are of the same composition, (c) major management 
engages in the same class, chairperson or CEO, (d) major shareholders has control or affiliation with real control, and (e) 
major shareholders has an investment relationship with each other. It can be seen from the above definition that there is a 
close relationship among the group members of the company. 

The corporation implies that the group members are closely related as to leadership structure and business 
decision-making power. However, there are different types of control. Control within the corporation type, which holds 
substantial control over a company, can dictate the company’s business decisions.  

The definition of the companies was adopted from the Taiwan Economic Journal, with group members that may be part 
of one family being the ultimate controllers of their own companies. The pattern of corporate control within the 
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corporation also implies that the company holds substantial control over its business decisions. Such control can be 
divided into four types: government control, single-family control, joint rule, and managerial control. There are 
relatively few government-controlled companies, and they often bear the same consideration of political or policy 
factors, thereby affecting the direction of the company’s business decisions. Moreover, they differ from standard 
companies that adopt corporate business profits as the primary objective of policy making. This study provides a 
comparative analysis of non-governmental types of control to understand whether the leadership structure of the board 
of directors (BOD) has differing effects on corporate performance. 

Single-family control is the most common type of conglomerate in Taiwan. This type of company is ultimately 
controlled by members of the family (including relatives and the control of legal persons) and has the advantage of an 
absolute majority with which other shareholders (if there are any) cannot compete. The controlling family members 
regularly appoint the BOD.  There is also typically a monopoly, with most directors being family members (it is 
common to see one-half or more of the board members be members of the family). As a result, family members 
completely dominate board decision making. The controlling family members also often hold key company positions, 
including those of CEO, chief financial officer (CFO), and other positions, to exercise even more control of the 
company’s operations. 

Jointly managed companies often have a more dispersed ownership structure. No single group of shareholders has the 
ultimate majority advantage. In this case, the ultimate controller would need to seek additional support from 
shareholders, so two or more groups usually control the board.  

Manager-controlled companies are the most common type of conglomerate in the Taiwan electronics industry.  The 
ultimate controller is required to have a professional and/or technical background. Apart from being appointed as the 
director, the ultimate controller is also the key person the company relies on for the practical operation of the company.  
Therefore, the ultimate controller serves in a senior position (CEO, CFO, or research and development (R&D) director). 

As can be seen, the composition of the board completely depends on the company type.  The impact of the composition 
of the board on the company’s operating performance is the focal point of this study. Claessens et al. (2000) investigated 
the influence of controlling shareholders in listed companies in Taiwan when the family controls the board. They found 
that the family would apply a pyramid ownership structure to ensure that they have management control. This includes 
pyramid shareholding for the use of cross-shareholdings.  As a result, their voting rights count more than their cash 
flow rights. The greater the difference between the cash flow rights and voting rights of the controlling shareholder, the 
lower the value of the company (Claessens et al., 2002). In addition, because of the family structure, the family 
shareholders and agents (family, CEO) have the same interests and, thus, reduce costs while increasing performance 
(Demsetz & Lehn, 1985; Westphal, 1999).  

A family CEO may be more competitively advantageous than a professional manager is in relation to acquiring the 
unique resources required by the company.  This is especially true in developing countries that have weak support for 
market access, because resources may not normally come from official channels (such as banks); these countries are in 
need of acquiring non-formal private networks (such as the Enterprise Group) (Peng, 2003). Although the family 
managers can reduce agency conflict, they also have an incentive to favor themselves and their family shareholders. This 
may result in reduced cash expenditures on investment strategies (Fama & Jensen, 1983; McConnell & Servaes, 1990), 
making the family-controlled company and its sales growth negatively correlated with poor financial performance 
(Oswald, Muse, & Rutherford, 2009).  

In conclusion, the views reflected in the literature regarding the impact of family control on a company’s business 
performance are inconsistent. Therefore, this paper will use different types of control of conglomerate companies to 
investigate the impact of the BOD’s composition on business performance. 

2.1 CEO Duality 

With regard to the correlation between board leadership structure and corporate performance for CEO duality, agency 
theory suggests that when the company owner is the CEO, and the manager is the agent, all requests for remaining 
compensation from the company will create agent losses. This means that managerial behavior will not be considered 
part of the compensation for the largest shareholder, unless there is an implementation of an appropriate governance 
structure to protect the interests of the shareholders (Jensen & Meckling, 1976). Safeguarding the interests of the 
shareholders is the chairperson of the board, who is not controlled by the CEO. There may also be an appropriate 
incentive program, so that the CEO and shareholders have the same interests (Williamson, 1985).  

Stewardship theory has a different point of view regarding effective board structure. The Butler model is built into the 
manager model. Unlike in agency theory, managers are assumed to be completely economically rational (Muth & 
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Donaldson, 1998). Managers trying to achieve high performance may meet and try to take action to benefit shareholders 
through profits (Donaldson & Davis, 1991). 

Regarding the impact of CEO duality on company performance, empirical studies have demonstrated different results. 
CEO duality reduces the board oversight of the CEO and, thus, company performance will be adversely affected (Levy, 
1981; Dayton, 1984). Since operating conditions for the operators have information superiority, they cannot really assess 
and control the behavior of the owner or operator.  This will create the possibility of speculation (Williamson, 1985). 
This reciprocal relationship, as chairperson and CEO, is found to be independent. However, if CEO duality prevails, then 
the reciprocity of the board will be compromised (Donaldson & Davis, 1991). In contrast, one study claimed that 
company CEO duality might reduce conflicts and improve corporate performance (Anderson & Anthony, 1986; 
Donaldson & Davis, 1991; Davis, Schoorman, & Donaldson, 1997). 

At present, there are no conclusive findings on the relationship between CEO duality and company performance. The 
current study is not intended to determine the influence of the chairperson and the CEO on company operating 
performance, but rather to establish the following hypothesis: 

H1: CEO duality and firm performance are related. 

2.2 The Internalization of the CEO  

Individuals or groups obtain, and are engaged in, decision making in public companies where control is the result of the 
purchase of company shares. The ultimate controller has the most influence on corporate decision making. 
Internalization refers to the CEO. The CEO is the ultimate controller (Lee, 2007). Internalization of the CEO means the 
CEO represents the ultimate controlling family or commissioning team. Therefore, the CEO should allow for collective 
interests to take precedence over individual interests. If a CEO is part of the family, he or she can quickly integrate the 
interests of the company and will achieve better performance (Anderson & Reeb, 2003). However, because some family 
businesses prefer their family members to work in the company and reject the use of external professional managers, 
they may adopt non-optimal investment strategies (Singell, 1997). Chang and Shin (2007) suggested that there is no 
relation between controlling family ownership and firm performance.  

This study is not intended to determine the impact of a CEO on the company’s operating performance, but to establish 
the following hypothesis: 

H2: The internalization of the CEO is related to firm performance.  

2.3 Composition of the Board of Directors  

The board of directors plays an important role in the corporate governance system (Fama & Jensen, 1983). According to 
agency theory, the BOD is primarily responsible for the supervision and control of management on behalf of the 
shareholders. Therefore, the board's composition will have an impact on the supervision of the BOD. The number of 
directors is an important factor in terms of effective corporate governance (Dalton, Daily, Johnson, & Ellstrand, 1999). A 
smaller BOD may be more efficient than a larger one, because it can engage in genuine interactions and debates 
(Firstenberg & Malkiel, 1994). A larger BOD will increase communication and coordination problems, thus reducing its 
management control capability over the company (Yermack, 1996; Eisenberg, Sundgren, & Wells, 1998; Chiang & Lin, 
2007). However, comparatively speaking, a large board size can provide greater mixtures of experts who are more 
capable of forming with the environment (Goodstein, Gautam, & Boeker, 1994). 

In this study, the size of the BOD and percentage of board ownership in the company are research variables used to 
understand the scale of the overall impact of the number of directors on the company’s operating performance. The 
results of previous studies are not conclusive; therefore, this study examined the data of listed companies in Taiwan to 
establish the following hypothesis: 

H3: Board size and firm performance are related. 

Since 2002, the Taiwan Stock Exchange and OTC Exchange Center have required newly listed companies to have two 
independent directors and one independent supervisor to strengthen the corporate governance mechanism. Board 
members and company management play an important supervisory role in protecting the interests of shareholders. An 
independent outside director is defined as the addition of foreign powers and responsibilities of directors that has no 
existing relationship with the company. Internal directors are directors of the company (Clifford & Evans, 1997).  

Stewardship theory states that inside directors contribute to the BOD because they provide expertise and talent and are 
more familiar with the quality of the CEO’s decisions about the company. (Wagner III, Stimpert, & Fubara, 1998). 
Studies have illustrated that a higher ratio of outside directors can reduce the probability of the company’s manager 
perpetrating financial fraud by managing earnings (Beasley, 1996; Peasnell, Pope, & Young, 2005; Klein, 2002).  A 



www.sciedu.ca/ijfr                    International Journal of Financial Research                 Vol. 2, No. 2; July 2011 

ISSN 1923-4023   E-ISSN 1923-4031 6

higher ratio of outside directors also has a positive relationship to firm performance (Pearce & Zahra, 1992). Thus, the 
following hypothesis is established: 

H4: The number of independent directors and firm performance are positively related. 

2.4 Stock-Control Rights   

Stock-control rights imply the right to vote (voting rights), which is a way to control company decision making. The 
right to vote is related to a person’s holdings. A two-way cross-shareholding structure is composed of indirect 
shareholdings through pyramid structures. Control of a company is related to cash equity investment, the acquisition of 
power of attorney to obtain shareholder voting rights, and seats on the board. The seat in control of direct and indirect 
ownership is the combined result of acquisition of the power of attorney and complete control of the company. 
Earnings-distribution rights, also known as cash flow rights, occur because shareholders are entitled to dividends (Lee, 
2007). 

The literature on corporate ownership shows that the separation between ownership and control has an important 
implication for firm performance (La Porta, Lopez-de-Silanes, Shleifer, & Vishny, 2002; Claessens et al., 2002; Baek, 
Kang, & Park, 2004). The literature suggests that pyramidal ownership may reduce firm performance (e.g., Claessens et 
al., 2002; Joh, 2003).  

Stock-control rights and seat-control rights rest with the ultimate controlling power of the company’s resources. The 
earnings-distribution right represents the final allocation of the right to control. If the two were similar, the interests of 
policy makers and decision-making consequences related to objectives and shareholder wealth would be more consistent 
and less likely to generate agency costs, and vice versa. Therefore, deviations from these two indicators could be used as 
the ultimate controlling agency cost index (Lee, 2007). Thus, the following hypotheses are established: 

H5: The non-alignment of stock-control rights and earnings-distribution rights is negatively related to firm performance. 

H6: The non-alignment of seat-control rights and stock-control rights is negatively related to firm performance. 

3. Data and Methodology 

3.1 Data 

In this study, data were obtained from the Taiwan Economic Journal database and the 2008 Taiwan Stock Exchange of 
listed and over-the-counter (OTC)-traded companies.  This database did not contain financial companies. The original 
number of companies was 1,225. Thirty-one companies were deleted from the database, and there were 19 
government-control-type companies.  There were 1,175 companies in the analyzed database.  

In this paper, Taiwan listed companies were grouped and compared to the first members of the group.  The list was 
composed of 724 companies, where 451 were not members of the group. This study involved a comparative analysis 
using three different types of controls to understand whether the leadership structure of the BOD would have a differing 
effect on corporate performance. There were 449 companies under single-family control (more than 62% of the 
database).  Ninety-four companies had joint rule and 181 companies were manager controlled. 

3.2 Variable Definitions 

3.2.1 Company Performance  

Company performance is the return on total assets (ROA) (net profit / average total assets × 100%) and return on equity 
(ROE) (net profit / average equity × 100%) as a measure of company performance variables.  These are the dependent 
variables in this study. 

3.2.2 CEO Duality (DUAL)  

Holding the position of managing director by the chairperson implies that the posts of a company’s CEO and chairperson 
are held by the same person; this is the dummy variable. When the company is set to 1, the CEO duality is 0. According 
to agency theory, CEO duality and corporate agency costs will have a negative relationship to performance. Therefore, 
we expect a negative sign. Conversely, the basis of stewardship theory is positive expectations. 

3.2.3 The Internalization of the CEO (INCEO)  

INCEO implies the ultimate control of the internalization. A family member is in the CEO position; this is the dummy 
variable. When the CEO is set to 1, the internalization is 0. In such cases, the CEO will be making business decisions to 
control the collective interests of the team and will be considering the priority of personal interests.  These decisions 
will be consistent with the majority of shareholders. Therefore, a positive and a negative sign will be expected. 
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3.2.4 Board Size (BS)  

BS as the total number of company directors and supervisors was used to measure variables. In the literature, the 
relationship between the number of board members and size of board and firm performance is not conclusive; therefore, 
one can expect both a positive and a negative sign. 

3.2.5 Board Holdings (BH) 

BH refers to the number of board ownership / number of shares outstanding at the year-end. Previous research has 
indicated that the relationship between shares held by directors and firm performance is not conclusive; therefore, expect 
a positive and a negative sign. 

3.2.6 Independent Director Number Tatio (IDS) 

IDS equals BOD for the company’s total number of independent board members / total number of board members. The 
IDS is independent of the independent BOD for the company management team. Monitoring performance and the 
literature illustrate a positive number representing the majority view; therefore, the expected sign is positive. 

3.2.7 Difference in Stock/Earnings (DSE) 

DSE is the stock-control right, or the earnings-distribution right. Stock control, also known as the right to vote, refers to 
a company being controlled by the ultimate controlling shareholding ratio. Earnings distribution is also known as cash 
flow rights; this implies those who ultimately control the distribution of earnings enjoyed by the right. If the said shares 
for positive control and cash flow rights deviate from the situation, the company should have a negative relationship 
with business performance. Therefore, we expect a negative sign. 

3.2.8 Difference in Seats/Stocks (DSS) 

DSS is equal to the seat-control right, or the stock-control right. Which seats are in control of the ultimate controller of a 
company? Is it the director number or total director number, or the board representation within the family? If the number 
of seats for positive control deviates from the current situation, the company should have a negative relationship with 
business performance. Therefore, we expect a negative sign. 

3.2.9 Company Size (SIZE)  

SIZE is the natural logarithm of the total assets of the company. The larger the size of the company, the better its ability 
to maintain operating performance. Therefore, the expected sign is positive. 

3.2.10 Sales Growth Ratio (SAG)  

SAG is equal to the (net operating income - net pre-operating income) / (initial net operating income) × 100%. The 
higher the revenue growth, the better the operating performance. Therefore, the expected sign is positive. 

3.2.11 Debt Ratio (DEBT) 

DEBT is equal to total liabilities / total assets × 100%. The higher the debt ratio, the more subject the company is to 
higher interest expenses and debt default risk. This would have a negative impact on business performance. Therefore, 
we expect a negative sign. 

3.3 Regression Model 

This study uses a multivariate regression analysis to examine the relationship of the independent variables to firm 
performance. The full regression model is as follows: 

Yj=β0 +β1DUAL+β2INCEO+β3BS+β4BH+β5IDS+β6DSE+β7DSS 

+β8SIZE+β9SAG+β10DEBT+ε                                                                   (1) 

Where: Y is denoted as firm performance and j = ROE, ROA. 

4. Empirical Results 

4.1 Descriptive Statistics  

Table 1 shows the descriptive statistics for the sampled companies. About 30% of the companies listed in Taiwan are of 
CEO duality (DUAL), compared with Hong Kong and companies in Asia, where 40% to 55% have a chairperson 
holding the post of CEO (Chen, Cheung, Stouraitis, & Wong, 2005; Lam & Lee, 2008). The leadership structure of the 
U.S. company board shows 70% to 80% of companies having a chairperson holding the post of CEO (Rechner & Dalton, 
1991; Rhoades, Rechner, & Sundaramurthy, 2001). In many European countries, the posts of chairperson and CEO of 
the company are held by a different person. Only 10% of United Kingdom listed companies are of CEO duality (Coles, 
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McWilliams, & Sen, 2001; Higgs, 2003; Kang & Zardkoohi, 2005). CEO duality differences are visible in Asia, Hong 
Kong, and Taiwan versus U.S. and European companies. Table 1 shows that 45% of the companies have an INCEO.  
This is significantly higher than the ratio of CEO duality. This implies that although some companies have the posts of 
chairperson and CEO held by separate people, the CEO of the company still has ultimate control over the management 
team appointed. 

The average board size (BS) is 9.36 and the average board holding (BH) is 23.4%. The average independent director size 
(IDS) is 1.33. Since February 2002, Taiwan's laws have required that newly listed companies have at least two 
independent directors to strengthen corporate governance. This law does not require all listed companies to follow suit.  
Therefore, independent BODs would not fully achieve the scale of a listed company, which must have at least two 
independent directors. The average difference in stock/earnings (DSE) of 5.6% illustrates the difference between 
share-control rights and cash flow rights in Taiwan listed companies. The minimum is 0, while the maximum is 74%. 
This indicates that the difference is a common phenomenon. A small number of companies have serious differences. The 
difference in seats/stocks (DSS) differs by an average of 25%, with a maximum of 87%. This reveals that Taiwanese 
listed companies have acquired control of the company and promised to obtain a proxy situation. This is a common 
phenomenon. 

< Table 1 about here> 

4.2 The Results of ROA Regression Model 

Table 2 illustrates an analysis table of the ROA linear regression model. The total return on assets is used as a proxy for 
business performance. In Model (1), the overall sample analysis found that CEO duality (DUAL) and operational 
performance were negatively correlated. This implies that performance will deteriorate when the same person is used, 
resulting in agency costs. Therefore, the company chairperson and the CEO are the same person.  The study found that 
listed companies in Taiwan with a chairperson concurrently serving as CEO supported the agency theory. Thus, H1 is 
supported.   

CEO duality and firm performance was found to be negatively related. The INCEO had no significant relationship to 
corporate performance. Therefore, H2 was not supported.  

The relationship between company performance and board size was not significant. The percentage of shares held by 
directors had a significant positive relationship. These results support H3. Independent BOD (IDS) and corporate 
performance have a significantly positive correlation.  The larger the scale of the independent directors and supervisors, 
the more people are required to monitor management’s performance. Therefore, better results in company performance 
supported H4. 

Stock control and board control work on behalf of the ultimate controlling power of the company’s resources. The 
surplus represents the final allocation of the right to control who assumes the identity of its shareholders.  This is an 
attempt to control the consequences of the corporate resources. The empirical data illustrated a surplus of Taiwan shares 
in listed companies, as well as seats deviating from the common shares of deviations. The difference in stock/earnings 
(DSE) and the difference in seats/stocks (DSS) and firm performance have a significant negative relationship. This may 
explain that decision making is inconsistent with the goal of shareholder wealth and has generated agency costs. 
Therefore, the results support H5 and H6. 

< Table 2 about here> 

Table 2 presents Model (2) and Model (3) results.  These show the comparative analysis of the sample conglomerates 
that found that CEO duality and firm performance factors exhibited a significant negative correlation. The seats of the 
independent directors and firm performance are significant factors and exhibited a positive correlation. This means that, 
regardless of groups or non-groups, when the offices of the company chairperson and CEO are held by the same person, 
performance will deteriorate. However, the larger the scale of independent directors and supervisors, the more the 
company can exercise its oversight operating levels of performance, and company performance will improve. Ratios of 
shares held by directors and firm performance in the conglomerate have a significant positive relationship. 

This paper categorizes the control of the company into clustering patterns, as in Model (4) for the joint-rule company, 
Model (5) for single-family control, and Model (6) for the manager-controlled company. A comparative analysis found 
that cohabitation patterns were only in DSE. Firm performance has a significant negative relationship. The other study 
variables (including control variables, SIZE, SAG, and DEBT) were not significantly different. Moreover, the percentage 
of shares held by directors has a significantly positive correlation with the company’s operating performance. It showed 
that the performance would deteriorate when the same person holds the office of the family-controlled company’s 
chairperson and CEO. This supports the agency theory. Single family-controlled and corporate manager-controlled 
companies would have better performance if the size of the independent BOD was larger.  
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The results illustrated that CEO duality is negatively related to firm performance in Taiwan's listed companies.  These 
results support agency theory. The percentage of shares held by the directors had a significantly positive relationship 
with the company’s operating performance, especially in the single-family company.   This shows that when a higher 
percentage of shares is held by directors in the group of a single-family company, the board members and shareholders 
may have more consistent interests, which may lead to better company performance. In addition to the independent 
BOD, except for joint-rule companies, the sample of companies and operational performance were significantly positive 
correlated in relation to the scale of the independent directors and supervisors.  These companies are more able to 
exercise their oversight over company performance levels, resulting in better overall company performance. The 
difference in stock/earnings and the difference in seats/stocks in the entire sample for the single-family company have a 
significant negative relationship with corporate performance. There are no significant relationships with firm 
performance in the manager-controlled company. 

4.3 The Results of ROE Regression Model 

Table 3 presents the ROE linear regression model analysis.  This analysis was focused on the return on equity (ROE) as 
a proxy for business performance. Model (7) presents the overall sample analysis and illustrates that CEO duality 
(DUAL) and operational performance were negatively correlated. Therefore, this supported the agency theory, which 
supports H1. The INCEO has a significant positive relationship with firm performance. This supports H2.  

The relationship between company performance and board size (BS) is not significant, but the percentage of shares held 
by directors (BH) does have a significant positive relationship. This partially supports H3. Independent BOD (IDS) and 
corporate performance have a significantly positive correlation. These results support H4. The difference in 
stock/earnings (DSE) and company earnings have a negative relationship with business performance. This supported H5. 

Table 3 presents the analysis results of the ROE linear regression model.  These results illustrate that Taiwan's listed 
companies’ CEO duality and firm performance were negatively related. This supports agency theory. The percentage of 
shares held by directors and the companies’ operating performance have a significantly positive relationship, especially 
in the single-family company.  This illustrates that a higher percentage of shares is held by directors in the 
single-family company.  Consequently, board members and shareholders may hold views that are more consistent with 
the interests of increasing performance. Independent director numbers of non-group and single-family companies 
showed positive performance. This performance was significantly related to the independent directors and supervisors, 
which implies that the larger the size of the companies, the better the performance. The difference in stock/earnings has 
a significant negative relationship with corporate performance. However, there is no significant relationship with firm 
performance in the manager-controlled company. 

< Table 3 about here> 

5. Conclusions 

The main contribution of this paper to the literature is to shed light on the processes of different managerial control types 
of conglomerates and how they influence firm performance. 

This paper used listed Taiwanese companies as the sample of companies to examine the effects of firm performance.  
Investigated variables included the leadership structure of the boards of directors, the effects of misalignment between 
stock-control rights, seat-control rights, and earnings-distribution rights. Relevant variables also included revenue 
growth, debt ratio, firm size variables, and their impact on corporate performance results. 

Company data were divided into conglomerates and non-conglomerates. The managerial control types of conglomerates 
were separated into joint-rule, single-family control, and manager-controlled companies.  

The misalignment between seat-control rights and stock-control rights shows the situation wherein someone acquires 
company control by purchasing powers of attorney from stockholders.  This situation exists in Taiwan. Internalization 
of the boards of directors is also common in Taiwan. The number of independent directors and company business 
performance have a significantly positive correlation. This shows that the larger the scale of the independent directors, 
the more they can monitor the performance of company management. Such a result is consistent with the direction of 
government regulations and policies. 

According to the linear cluster regression model, the single family-controlled company is more prevalent in Taiwan than 
the other types of companies. As for the joint-rule patterns in the company that has a dispersed ownership structure and 
only deviates from stock-control rights and earnings-distribution rights, company performance has a significant negative 
relationship. In contrast, a single family-controlled company has a negative correlation with CEO duality, the 
non-alignment of stock-control rights, earnings-distribution rights, seat-control rights, and company performance. The 
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ratio of shares held by the directors and the independent board of directors was positive and significantly correlated with 
company performance. This may explain the phenomenon of the current board composition in the Taiwan listed 
company structure and the relationship with firm performance.  

Kim et al. (2007) investigated the ownership structure of Korea’s chaebols and suggested that if controlling families 
have greater direct shareholdings in firms, they would have greater contribution to group control. In this paper, we found 
that a single family-controlled company is more prevalent in Taiwan’s conglomerates. A larger percentage of shares held 
by directors would induce better firm performance in family-controlled companies. 

The manager-controlled pattern is common in Taiwan's electronics industry. Therefore, the analysis illustrated that, apart 
from the significant positive correlation between the numbers of independent directors and company performance, the 
remaining outcomes of the primary variables were not significant. This explains the controller of the company as the 
professional manager, while the correlation between the structure of the board of directors and company performance is 
less significant. However, independent directors are still important as oversight mechanisms. 

The empirical results and findings of this paper provide reference for the relevant competent authorities in Taiwan to 
strengthen corporate governance policy. For instance, independent director size is positively related to corporate 
performance, which implies that the more independent directors there are, the more they are able to play a monitoring 
role over the management’s performance and, hence, the better able they are to improve company performance. This 
result is consistent with the policy direction of government regulations on listed companies, but the number of 
independent directors and supervisors only exists in listed companies after 2002. Hence, this result suggests a gradual 
integration of applicable requirements for all companies. When the agency problem of the chairperson of the board also 
serving as the CEO arises, there should be a policy to guide improvement. In addition, differences in the share control of 
cash flow rights in Taiwanese listed companies exist. The small numbers of companies have serious deviations and 
departures from the seats. The acquisition of shares to obtain control of the company is also a common phenomenon. In 
such a situation, a company would have a negative performance impact on the stakeholders. It is also worthy of note that 
different types of firms have different relationships with business performance. These findings are also relevant to 
investments of the public and interested parties in relation to decision making. 
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Table 1. Descriptive statistics 

 N Minimum Maximum Mean S.D. Medium

ROA 1175 -0.912 0.453 0.051 0.118 0.058

ROE 1175 -3.131 0.751 0.005 0.253 0.048

DUAL 1175 0.000 1.000 0.297 0.457 0.000

INCEO 1175 0.000 1.000 0.452 0.498 0.000

BS 1175 5.000 32.000 9.363 2.264 9.000

BH 1175 0.020 0.950 0.234 0.144 0.200

IDS 1175 0.000 0.714 0.133 0.149 0.000

DSE 1175 0.000 0.740 0.055 0.100 0.014

DSS 1175 -0.650 0.865 0.249 0.229 0.244

SIZE 1175 11.143 20.290 15.081 1.339 14.918

SAG 1175 -1.000 20.548 0.036 1.051 -0.038

DEBT 1175 0.015 1.115 0.367 0.180 0.355

Notes: ROA: (net profit / average total assets * 100%). ROE: (net profit / average equity * 100%). DUAL: is a dummy 
variable that is set to 1 when there is CEO duality and 0 otherwise. INCEO: is a dummy variable that is set to 1 when 
there is CEO internalization and 0 otherwise. BS: The total number of company directors and supervisors. BH: (the 
number of board ownership / number of shares outstanding at the year-end). IDS: (total number of independent board 
members / total number of board members). DSE: (the stock-control right- the earnings-distribution right). DSS: (the 
seat-control right - the stock-control right). SIZE: the natural log value of the total assets of the company. SAG: (Net 
operating income - net pre-operating income) / (initial net operating income) * 100%. DEBT: Total liabilities / total 
assets * 100%.  
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Table 2. ROA regression model analysis 

 
Expected 

sign 
Model (1) Model (2) Model (3) Model (4) Model (5) Model (6) 

  Full Non-Conglomerate Conglomerate Joint-rule 
Single-family 

control 

Managerial 

control 

Intercept  -0.300 *** -0.571 *** -0.271 *** -0.167  -0.251 *** -0.235 ***

  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.289)  (0.000)  (0.005)  

DUAL +/- -0.029 *** -0.034 *** -0.020 ** -0.025  -0.026 ** 0.006  

  (0.000)  (0.008)  (0.045)  (0.440)  (0.037)  (0.740)  

INCEO +/- 0.010  0.012  -0.003  0.030  -0.005  -0.032  

  (0.165)  (0.323)  (0.722)  (0.297)  (0.646)  (0.127)  

BS +/- -0.001  0.000  -0.001  0.001  -0.001  0.003  

  (0.358)  (0.962)  (0.561)  (0.798)  (0.559)  (0.429)  

BH +/- 0.061 ** -0.101  0.081 *** 0.099  0.105 *** -0.014  

  (0.020)  (0.834)  (0.008)  (0.287)  (0.004)  (0.835)  

IDS + 0.097 *** 0.106 *** 0.093 *** -0.114  0.092 ** 0.118 ** 

  (0.000)  (0.006)  (0.002)  (0.282)  (0.024)  (0.024)  

DSE - -0.101 *** -0.285 *** -0.046  -0.293 ** -0.092 * 0.062  

  (0.005)  (0.001)  (0.263)  (0.033)  (0.058)  (0.456)  

DSS - -0.048 *** -0.026  -0.047 ** -0.066  -0.056 ** -0.029  

  (0.006)  (0.403)  (0.023)  (0.302)  (0.023)  0.528  

SIZE + 0.029 *** 0.050 *** 0.025 *** 0.018 * 0.023 *** 0.023 ***

  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.090)  (0.000)  (0.000)  

SAG + 0.010 *** 0.058 *** 0.006 * 0.072 ** 0.003  0.182 ***

  (0.001)  (0.000)  (0.061)  (0.036)  (0.358)  (0.000)  

DEBT - -0.204 *** -0.245 *** -0.182 *** -0.173 *** -0.154 *** -0.250 ***

  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.010)  (0.000)  (0.000)  

Adjusted R2 0.186  0.277  0.188  0.099  0.157  0.434  

F-value 27.870 *** 18.266 *** 17.726 *** 2.023 ** 9.340 *** 14.798 ***

N 1175  451  724  94  449  181  

Notes: ROA: (net profit / average total assets * 100%). ROE: (net profit / average equity * 100%). DUAL: is a dummy 
variable that is set to 1 when there is CEO duality and 0 otherwise. INCEO: is a dummy variable that is set to 1 when 
there is CEO internalization and 0 otherwise. BS: The total number of company directors and supervisors. BH: (the 
number of board ownership / number of shares outstanding at the year-end). IDS: (total number of independent board 
members / total number of board members). DSE: (the stock-control right- the earnings-distribution right). DSS: (the 
seat-control right - the stock-control right). SIZE: the natural log value of the total assets of the company. SAG: (Net 
operating income - net pre-operating income) / (initial net operating income) * 100%. DEBT: Total liabilities / total 
assets * 100%. *p<.10, **p<.05, ***p<.01. 
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Table 3. ROE regression model analysis 

 
Expected 

sign 
Model (7) Model (8) Model (9) Model (10) Model (11) Model (12) 

  Full Non-Conglomerate Conglomerate Joint-rule 
Single-family 

control 

Managerial 

control 

Intercept  -0.674 *** -1.359 *** -0.540 *** -0.452  -0.396 *** -0.548 **

  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.000) (0.113)  (0.000)  (0.011)  

DUAL +/- -0.066 *** -0.035  -0.069 *** 0.025  -0.061 *** -0.070  

  (0.000)  (0.206)  (0.001) (0.665)  (0.008)  (0.159)  

INCEO +/- 0.034 ** 0.014  0.022 0.032  0.013  -0.007  

  (0.034)  (0.607)  (0.275) (0.542)  (0.542)  (0.894)  

BS +/- -0.005  -0.003  -0.004 0.001  -0.002  0.002  

  (0.109)  (0.616)  (0.233) (0.926)  (0.574)  (0.874)  

BH +/- 0.119 ** -0.024  0.139 ** 0.119  0.173 ** 0.039  

  (0.035)  (0.812)  (0.031) (0.476)  (0.011)  (0.823)  

IDS + 0.129 ** 0.263 *** 0.063 -0.293  0.132 *** 0.054  

  (0.012)  (0.002)  (0.317) (0.129)  (0.008)  (0.690)  

DSE - -0.308 *** -1.016 *** -0.138 -0.484 * -0.256 *** 0.024  

  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.106) (0.052)  (0.005)  (0.912)  

DSS - -0.056  0.010  -0.071 -0.112  -0.059  -0.049  

  (0.135)  (0.887)  (0.102) (0.333)  (0.193)  (0.680)  

SIZE + 0.059 *** 0.108 *** 0.049 *** 0.043 ** 0.034 *** 0.055 ***

  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.000) (0.027)  (0.000)  (0.000)  

SAG + 0.017 *** 0.107 *** 0.009 0.214 *** 0.000 *** 0.355 ***

  (0.010)  (0.000)  (0.169) (0.001)  (0.988)  (0.000)  

DEBT - -0.477 *** -0.500 *** -0.456 *** -0.517 *** -0.275 *** -0.852 ***

  (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.000) (0.000)  (0.000)  (0.000)  

Adjusted R2 0.182  0.280  0.187 0.235  0.114  0.423  

F-value 27.057 *** 18.512 *** 17.655 *** 3.856 *** 6.741 *** 14.215 ***

N 1175  451  724 94  449  181  

Notes: ROA: (net profit / average total assets * 100%). ROE: (net profit / average equity * 100%). DUAL: is a dummy 
variable that is set to 1 when there is CEO duality and 0 otherwise. INCEO: is a dummy variable that is set to 1 when 
there is CEO internalization and 0 otherwise. BS: The total number of company directors and supervisors. BH: (the 
number of board ownership / number of shares outstanding at the year-end). IDS: (total number of independent board 
members / total number of board members). DSE: (the stock-control right- the earnings-distribution right). DSS: (the 
seat-control right - the stock-control right). SIZE: the natural log value of the total assets of the company. SAG: (Net 
operating income - net pre-operating income) / (initial net operating income) * 100%. DEBT: Total liabilities / total 
assets * 100%. *p<.10, **p<.05, ***p<.01. 


