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Abstract 

Organisational artefacts are materials, buildings, symbols, names, images, logos, catchwords that make sense to all the 
stakeholders of an organisation; they therefore have meanings and do not just exist. Artefacts demonstrate the culture, 
norms and values of those who are in the organisation as well as all its stakeholders. In a nutshell it is a medium of 
communication within the members of the organisation and those outside the organisation; it makes enormous 
statements. This paper employing the descriptive/historical approach will examine the impacts of organisational artefacts 
on business organisations including how it helps in the development of a corporate identity in the organisations. This is 
more so as an organisation’s identity –expressed partly through organisational artefacts- goes directly to the heart of the 
existence of the organisation. The study concludes that directly and indirectly, knowingly and unknowingly, 
organisational artefacts enhance the development of corporate identity.  
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1. Introduction 

There is recently a shift on the emphasis on corporate branding from line branding as there is a need to better appreciate 
the role and the importance of organisational artefacts in the development of corporate identity (Balmer, 1995; Mitchell, 
1997). Corporate identities therefore refer to the ‘engaging and influential conceptualizations of the organisation, which 
are relatively shared by members and/or upheld by its leaders, and often emphasized in formal corporate statements 
(mission, vision etc) and expressions (logos, buildings, symbols, etc)’ (Lerpold et al., 2007:2). Our focus in this study 
will be the latter part of the definition, ‘expressions (logos, buildings, symbols) and the impact of these expressions’ on 
the corporate identities. These expressions or organisational artefacts help in answering the following questions: ‘Who 
are we?’; ‘What kind of organisation is this?’; ‘What makes us different from, or similar to, other organisations?’ Who 
do we compare with? And ‘Who is our benchmark or role model?’  

Lerpold et al. (2007:5) perceive organisational/corporate identity as the ‘result of the interplay of three closely 
connected and sometimes overlapping elements: formal claims (i.e., ‘what we say we are as an organisation’); members’ 
beliefs and understandings about what is central, enduring, and distinctive about their organisation (i.e., ‘what we think 
we are as an organisation’); and the managers’ aspirations about it (i.e. , ‘what we would like our organization to be’), 
or what is sometimes referred to as desired identity’ .  

These three elements: identity claims, identity beliefs and identity aspirations can be illustrated or made manifest 
through organisational artefacts like uniforms, logos, visuals, buildings etc (Lerpold, et al., 2007: 174-175 & 197; Olins, 
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1989; Pratt and Rafaeli, 1997; Ravasi and Schultz, 2006). These expressions and manifestations of 
organisational/corporate identity are usually in form of objects and symbols. A symbol according to Saussure (1996) is 
something that represents or suggests something else through associations, norms or conventions. The meaning of a 
symbol is usually rooted in its cultural significance (Thompson, et al, 1996); the communication of which is interpreted 
thorough the eventual production of symbols that make the world meaningful (Putman, et al., 1996). 

Culture has been variously defined as the way of life of a group of people (Akporherhe, 2002); Becker (1986:13) 
suggests that culture ‘explains how people act in concert when they do share understanding.’ quoting Taylor (1921), 
Olurode (1994) suggests that culture is that whole, which includes knowledge, belief, art, moral, law, custom and other 
capabilities and habits acquired by man as a member of the society. Geertz (1973a) suggests that culture is the entire 
way of life of a people, including their technology and material artefacts; Hofstede and Hofstede (2005:3) simply define 
culture as ‘software of the mind’. From the above definitions and explanations of ‘culture’, it is obvious that wherever a 
group of people come together there are bond to be some norms, values, conventions that will bind them together part of 
which will manifest through their artefacts, this is referred to as organisational culture.  

Unfortunately, people are often not aware of the model represented by their organisational culture until it is questioned 
or until they come into contact with a new culture or until it is presented and explained (Snopko,2011). In the view of 
May (2001), culture can be infused throughout the organisation by expressing it in the artefacts of the organisation. 
Artefacts can be considered as mental models which mediate activity (Milne, 2010). 

Organisational or corporate culture has attracted much attention in both management and management practices 
literature in recent times (Deal and Kennedy, 1988; Denison, 1990; Peters and Waterman, 1982; Lau and Ngo, 1996; 
Mintzberg, 1989). It has also been variously defined as the history of an organisation or what allows employees to 
understand their workplace, it also makes the employees to make sense of work activities and to relate them to daily 
events (Porter, 1990). Williams et al (1993) define it as the beliefs, attitudes and values that are commonly-held and that 
are relatively stable within an organisation. Hall (1995:25) sees it simply as ‘the way we do things around here’; which 
is ‘embodied in symbols, rituals and hero’s which are reflected in organisational communications, manners, dress codes, 
social rules and norms, and role models’ (Mwaura et al, 1998). The functions of organisational culture include passing 
on of knowledge, handling strong emotions, uniting and providing meanings; it also forms one of the basis for 
competitive advantage (Deal and Kennedy, 1988; Randlesome and Brierly, 1990). It helps in determining the 
effectiveness of a company (Denison, 1990); it is important in developing high performance amongst staff (O’ Reilly, 
1989) and also helps in increasing the loyalty of staff to the organisation (Porter, 1990).  

From the above discussions it can be inferred that organisational artefacts can help in communication within an 
organisation as well as be a shared bond that ties members of the organisation together; this may be deliberately or 
unknowingly created. For example an organisation that adopted a lion as its logo is talking of boldness (in terms of 
competition), and leadership (probably a market leader). Members of the organisation will have to perceive the 
organisation as a lion and consciously or unconsciously behave like lions.  

2. Conceptual Background 

The last two or three decades have witnessed an increase of interest in the study of corporate/organisational identity by 
two distinct, but inextricably linked academic disciplines: the marketing discipline which refers to it as ‘corporate 
identity’ while the organisational behaviour discipline refers to it as ‘organisational identity’ (Balmer and Wilson, 1993). 
Researchers from the marketing and general management will want to answer the following questions: What is corporate 
identity? What is the purpose of corporate identity management? And what is an organisation? (Balmer, 1995; Balmer 
and Wilson, 1998)  

Corporate identity according to van Riel and Balmer (1997) (while quoting the International Corporate Identity Group’s 
statement) is interpreted as an organisation’s ethos, aims and values that create a sense of individuality which 
differentiate a brand from another brand. De Chernatony (1999) building on Kapferer’s (1997) brand-based view of 
identity, simply defines it as the process of narrowing the gap between a brand’s identity and its reputation. De 
Chernatony ( 1999) further suggested that brand identity consists of six components: vision and culture which drives the 
brand’s desired for which the organisation is known which then drive the brand’s desired positioning, personality and 
subsequent relationships all of which are then presented to reflect stakeholders’ actual and inspirational self-images 

Balmer and Stotvig (1997) posit that securing a competitive advantage is the main objective of corporate identity; it is 
assumed that once an organisation is able to put in place an effective management of its identity, the organisation will in 
due cause acquire a positive and favourable corporate image and reputation and the end result will be that the major 
stakeholders will view the organisation favourably and positively. Scholars in the organisational behaviour discipline 
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view organisational identity as the way the employees identify with the organisation (Hatch and Schultz, 1997). Albert 
and Whetten (1995) view organisational identity as the elements within an organisation that are central, enduring and 
distinctive; this to a large extent will help in answering questions such as: ‘to what extent do employees identify with the 
organisation? And, ‘What do employees identify within the organisation? 

Balmer and Wilson (1998:4) suggest that despite ‘the heightened interest in corporate identity by academics and 
managers, there is still confusion and ambiguity as to the nature of corporate identity’. Balmer, (1997) identified six 
reasons why the ‘confusion and ambiguity’ still exist; they are (1) confusion caused by the terminology (2) influence of 
fashion which keeps changing everyday (3) the association with graphic design (4) the dearth of academic empirical 
research (5) the inappropriateness of the positivistic research paradigm for undertaking research in corporate identity 
during its early stage of development and (6) the weaknesses in available models of corporate image and identity.  

This paper intends to examine how organisational artefacts can be used to develop both organisational identity and 
corporate identity so that both disciplines and group of scholars can have a common ground from which to learn from 
(Hatch and Schultz, 1997). This is beacuse according to Balmer and Wilson (1993:4) ‘marketers and organisational 
behaviourists have much to learn from each other’s literatures’. Moreover, Balmer (1995) and Ramanantsoa (1989) 
argue that more scholars have started clinging to the fact that corporate identity simply refers to an organisation’s unique 
characteristics that are rooted in the behaviour of employees. This probably was why several scholars (Balmer, 1995; 
Hatch and Schultz, 1997; van Riel and Balmer, 1997) argued that corporate identity does not sit firmly in one area of 
management but belongs to several disciplines and that this is why scholars (van Riel and Balmer, 1997) recommended 
that multidisciplinary approach should always be adopted while discussing corporate identity.  

Corporate culture which usually manifests through organisational artefacts has always been included in the conceptual 
models of corporate identity and corporate image formation; this explains why contemporary corporate identity 
consultancies have stressed the importance of both national culture and corporate culture while attempting to analyse or 
design corporate identity (Abratt, 1989; Balmer, 1997; Dowling, 1994).  

Downey (1986/1987) (quoted in Balmer and Wilson, 1998:7) perceives corporate identity as the source of corporate 
culture; he (1986/1987) further suggested that corporate/organisational culture which can been be depicted as a 
company’s shared values, beliefs and behaviour actually flows from and is the consequence of corporate identity. Olins 
(1978) sees the concept of corporate identity as the concept of the corporate personality. Balmer and Wilkinson (1991) 
suggest that corporate identity refers to the values that are held in high esteem by employees within an organisation. 
Some scholars such as Abratt (1989); Birkight and Stadler (1986); Lux (1986) and Olins, (1989) have all argued that 
corporate personality is at the hub of an organisation’s corporate identity. One of the major features of the corporate 
identity literature is the fact that organisations have a single company culture; which manifests partly through 
organisational artefacts (Balmer and Wilson, 1989). 

Organisational behaviourists including Scott (1987) suggested that organisations are much more concerned about 
corporate culture as it helps in sustaining commitment of employees towards the good of the whole organisation. It is 
assumed that individual employee who has legitimately internalised the norms, values and conventions (usually 
expressed through organisational artefacts) of the organisation will engage in co-operative and spontaneous behaviour in 
his/her service to the organisation (Balmer and Wilson, 1998). 

Martin and Meyerson (1988) suggest three major perspectives in corporate culture as: Integration, differentiation and 
fragmentation. Integration perspective is a situation where there is an organisation-wide consensus and consistency; this 
is a strong and desirable corporate culture. The values, norms and conventions (which mainly manifests through 
organisational artefacts) are consistent with formal practices which are consistent with informal beliefs, norms and 
attitudes. Organisational members share the same values which help in promoting a shared sense of loyalty which 
enhances commitment to the organisation (Barley, 1983; Deal and Kennedy, 1982; Peter and Waterman, 1982).  

Differentiation perspective: Consensus does not form the corporate culture but only exists in the sub-culture; it 
(consensus) is therefore not organisational-wide. The sub-culture is related to different jobs, different levels of 
organisational status, gender and class; there exists therefore a mixture of sub-cultural differences within the same 
organisation (Van Maanen, 1991). Fragmentation perspective: Ambiguity is viewed as the norm while consensus and 
dimension only co-exist in a constantly changing pattern which is influenced by events and specific areas of 
decision-making. Consensus fails to unite on an organisation-wide basis and not even on sub-cultural based; only in 
brief and issue- specific ways (Frost et al, 1991). We are going to argue in this paper that it is cheaper and more 
effective to use organisational artefacts to build a solid corporate/organisational culture which will help in building an 
enduring organisational.  
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3. Methodology and Method 

3.1 Historical /Descriptive Research Method/Approach  

This study being historical and descriptive relied on the secondary sources. Secondary data are data collected and 
recorded by someone else prior to and for purposes other than the current needs of the researcher (Harris, 2001). 
Secondary data is usually historical and already collected data that does not necessitate access to respondents or subjects 
(Ember and Levinson, 1991). The major advantage of this source of data collection is the fact that it is less expensive 
than the primary source of data collection (Zikmund, 1984).  

If one also looks at the fact that nowhere in science do we start from scratch, it is therefore a good source of proceeding 
with a research even if one will still have to go back to the primary source; there is something handy one can use as a 
starting point (Kaplan, 1964). One can also build on the researches already conducted by other people using the 
secondary source as the basis of judgement. There are some instances where only the secondary sources can be used and 
there was no way of considering primary source at all; for example a researcher conducting researches into events that 
happened a long time ago has no other choice than to depend on secondary source (Harris, 1991).  

The four main purposes of secondary sources methodology are: to describe, to explain, to validate findings and to infer 
from all the findings having been validated to be true (Black and Champion, 1976). Description emerges following the 
creative exploration, and helps to arrange the findings in an order that will help to be fit for explanations and these 
explanations can then be tested to validate the variables being studied and with the aid of description, knowledge is 
illuminated and facts that were ignored can now be brought to light and better understood (Whiting, 1964). This method 
also helps in describing natural and man-made phenomena that will be very useful to other researchers and policymakers 
while prediction is also made easier at least to some extent (Borg and Gall, 1989). 

4. Discussions 

Maier (1967) suggested that many organisational problems could be linked to inadequate communication between 
superiors and their subordinates, whose task was to implement their decisions. The issue of lack of clarity of 
communications in organisations between management and workers, between managers and junior workers, between 
workers and workers as well as communications between the organisations and their customers along with other 
stakeholders cannot be taken for granted, therefore all efforts must be put on board to safe the situation. Organisational 
artefacts as mentioned earlier can aid effective communication in the organisation and members of the organisation are 
able to communicate informally and act in a more coherent manner which on the long run will likely enhance the 
likelihood of their activities as well as support the desired identity. This is could be done through the acceptance of 
organisational artefacts by all members of the organisation which could be a reminder of the values, norms and 
conventions of the organisation as well as a socialisation instrument which enhances the organisation’s identity. 

According to Freeman and Liedtka (1997) the role of employees is now changing as they can no longer be considered 
under the category ‘firm’; they are now to be considered as corporate ‘ambassadors’ (Hemsley, 1998) of their various 
organisations. Employees are also the interface between the corporate internal and external environments which 
invariably have a powerful impact on consumers’ perception of both the brand and the organisation as a whole 
(Schneider and Bowen, 1985; Balmer and Wilkinson, 1991). With organisational artefacts well in place employees can 
identify with them, and the goals of the organisation will be clearer to all the stakeholders which is likely to increase the 
loyalty and the commitment of the corporate ‘ambassadors’ to the advantage of the organisation as a whole. 

5. Conclusion 

As discussed earlier, organisational artefacts are very crucial to the effective internalisation of corporate/organisational 
culture while corporate/organisational identity is enhanced by corporate/organisation culture. Hofstede and Hofstede 
(2005:3) define national culture simply as the ‘software of the mind’. It is therefore important, cheaper and more 
effective for organisations to invest on organisational artefacts in order to imprint the organisational culture in the 
‘minds’ of their workers which will enhance their commitment and probably increase their productivity. Also as visuals 
last longer in the minds of people, organisational artefacts will help in reinforcing the values, norms and conventions of 
the organisation. As mentioned earlier, it is also cheaper and more effective especially when compared with the 
organisations of conferences, seminars and retreats in order to help in imprinting the values, norms and conventions of 
the organisation on the minds of its employees and other stakeholders.  
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